
[[SWA526801 ALTER]] SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3662 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP454259
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA526801 ALTER

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: CRAIG WHITEHOUSEcraig.whitehouse@altg.comT: (309)255-6706F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10993991Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06158568 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:06:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CRAIG WHITEHOUSE - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454259 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3968 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 65.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 16 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 29 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1730 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 616 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1072 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 37 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06158568 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:06:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CRAIG WHITEHOUSE - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3662\Drop Box [VCP454259] 17 Apr 2024 @ 3968.0 hrs

