
VOLVO A25G 742401 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP0007820
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.The copper levelis severe. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10993998Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06158575 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:07:17) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007820 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 13 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 541 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3178 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1334 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1215 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 114 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06158575 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:07:22) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742401\Brake Cooling System [VCP0007820] 03 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

