
[[737904]] VOLVO A45G 342066 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP282653
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 737904

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: ED MAYESEMAYES@ROMCO.COMT: (737)204-9402F: (512)388-2673
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10994122Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 06158699 (Generated: 04/25/2024 12:49:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP282653 VCP423977 --- ---Sample Date 10 Apr 2024 28 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 15989 0 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.4 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 8.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 63 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.3 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 57 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.5 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 5 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 4 --- ---Copper ppm 0 2 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 132 119 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1793 1513 --- ---Magnesium ppm 669 658 --- ---Zinc ppm 962 853 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 817 707 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 288 284 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 06158699 (Generated: 04/25/2024 12:49:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342066\Diesel Engine [VCP282653] 10 Apr 2024 @ 15989.0 hrs

