
[[737904 MARTIN MARIET]] VOLVO A45G 342066 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP282732
Oil Type: CHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL  AW ISO 46
Job No: 737904 MARTIN MARIET

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: ED MAYESEMAYES@ROMCO.COMT: (737)204-9402F: (512)388-2673
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. We were unable to performa particle count due to a highconcentration of particles present inthis sample.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Viscosity of sample indicatesoil is within ISO 68 range, adviseinvestigate. Confirm oil type. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10994440Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 06159017 (Generated: 05/04/2024 04:23:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP282732 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 15989 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 66.33 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.92 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2035 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 776 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 636 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 06159017 (Generated: 05/04/2024 04:23:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342066\Hydraulic System [VCP282732] 10 Apr 2024 @ 15989.0 hrs

