
[[IMPORT AUTO SEFFNER]] VOLVO ECR235EL 311427 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP452092
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: IMPORT AUTO SEFFNER

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Theiron level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10995722Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06160299 (Generated: 04/26/2024 14:46:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452092 VCP425791 VCP394450 VCP376643Sample Date 30 Jan 2024 15 Jun 2023 09 Mar 2023 21 Jul 2022Machine Hours 5324 4260 3792 2768Oil Hours 0 2000 1792 500Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 55.3 51.1 44.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.21 0.26 0.38
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 148207 1887 2716 8547Particles >6µm 49773 225 434 2501Particles >14µm 533 12 23 299ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/23/16 18/15/11 19/16/12 20/19/15Silicon ppm 2 2 2 2Sodium ppm 2 0 1 0Potassium ppm 0 1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 13 12 7Copper ppm 14 12 10 9Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 2 2 4Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 67 75 96 154Magnesium ppm 2 4 9 14Zinc ppm 335 288 313 407Phosphorus ppm 268 222 248 313Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 <1 1 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06160299 (Generated: 04/26/2024 14:46:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235EL 311427\Hydraulic System [VCP452092] 30 Jan 2024 @ 5324.0 hrs

