
[[SPM701405]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2718 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP426446
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM701405

BELSON STEEL1685 N STATE RTE 50BOURBONNAIS, ILUS  60914Contact: M. POZANmpozan@belsonsteel.comT: (815)932-7416F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: BELBOUUnique No: 10996150Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Apr 2024
Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 06160727 (Generated: 04/30/2024 13:25:46) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426446 VCP433818 VCP415010 VCP423380Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 07 Dec 2023 12 Sep 2023 25 May 2023Machine Hours 9760 8880 8383 7855Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 138 138 160 136
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.074 NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 2 11 3Sodium ppm 0 1 10 <1Potassium ppm 0 1 4 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 51 88 184 41Copper ppm 18 381 <1 174Lead ppm 0 4 0 2Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 13 3 6Chromium ppm 0 <1 6 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 12 6 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 64 57 47 652Magnesium ppm 4 2 2 9Zinc ppm 37 194 17 411Phosphorus ppm 623 618 290 1653Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 16 20 0 130

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 06160727 (Generated: 04/30/2024 13:25:49) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2718\Front Left Final Drive [VCP426446] 12 Apr 2024 @ 9760.0 hrs

