
VOLVO EC200EL 314968 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP449079
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of visible silt present in thesample. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10996246Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Apr 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06160823 (Generated: 04/29/2024 11:32:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449079 VCP386238 VCP340272 VCP298876Sample Date 02 Feb 2024 30 Nov 2022 29 Oct 2021 17 Mar 2021Machine Hours 13818 13003 12669 12098Oil Hours 0 1500 1500 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 27.9 28.1 26.8
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 7 4 5 <1Sodium ppm 4 4 0 1Potassium ppm 2 2 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 18 20 16Copper ppm 17 21 22 21Lead ppm 0 1 <1 0Tin ppm 1 1 1 1Aluminum ppm 9 7 8 9Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 2 1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 3 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 91 87 89 87Magnesium ppm 3 2 1 1Zinc ppm 36 19 29 3Phosphorus ppm 182 190 182 165Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 61 69 70 68

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06160823 (Generated: 04/29/2024 11:32:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314968\Transmission (Auto) [VCP449079] 02 Feb 2024 @ 13818.0 hrs

