
[[700877 DIPRO]] CATERPILLAR 972M HLSJ02687 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP445527
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 700877 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10996684Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06161261 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:02:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445527 VCP452308 VCP431157 VCP414163Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 27 Dec 2023 25 Sep 2023 10 Jul 2023Machine Hours 17043 15831 15087 14435Oil Hours 0 500 500 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 8.85 7 6.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 5.7 3.6 1.0Oxidation (PA) % 74 96 118 189
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.6 0.4 0.7Nitration (PA) % 87 101 90 135Sulfation (PA) % 58 62 69 91Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.1 19.8 36.9 33.0Silicon ppm 9 4 3 6Sodium ppm 13 3 2 4Potassium ppm 2 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 79 32 23 51Copper ppm 2 2 2 2Lead ppm <1 <1 2 16Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 5 4 <1 5Chromium ppm 1 2 1 3Molybdenum ppm 61 47 37 35Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1254 787 628 659Magnesium ppm 977 747 591 597Zinc ppm 1310 951 742 770Phosphorus ppm 1095 776 588 651Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06161261 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:02:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 972M HLSJ02687\Diesel Engine [VCP445527] 15 Apr 2024 @ 17043.0 hrs

