
[[700877 DIPRO]] CATERPILLAR 982M 2686 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP446955
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 700877 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10996799Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06161376 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:01:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446955 VCP442420 VCP452302 VCP383064Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 29 Feb 2024 28 Dec 2023 19 Jan 2023Machine Hours 14054 16558 12902 10401Oil Hours 2000 0 4000 2000Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 41.9 48.0 53.0Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.63 0.75 1.34 1.51
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 59472 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 6323 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 184 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 <1 12 14Sodium ppm 3 3 3 4Potassium ppm 0 0 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 43 28 6 2Copper ppm 4 6 9 3Lead ppm 0 0 2 3Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 3 1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 118 68 160 144Magnesium ppm 0 0 6 2Zinc ppm 630 547 790 686Phosphorus ppm 473 419 542 496Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 <1 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06161376 (Generated: 05/04/2024 01:02:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 982M 2686\Hydraulic System [VCP446955] 18 Apr 2024 @ 14054.0 hrs

