
[[702821 ALTA RENTS]] VOLVO L90H 626583 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP454748
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 702821 ALTA RENTS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10996801Signed:Report Date:
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06161378 (Generated: 04/29/2024 15:13:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513Sample No. : VCP454748Lab Number : 06161378Unique Number : 10996801Test Package : MOB 2

Received : 26 Apr 2024Tested : Diagnosed : 
To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.
* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.
Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06161378 (Generated: 04/29/2024 15:13:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10996801-4414470&lid=10996801&oem_template=VOLVO
http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626583\Hydraulic System [VCP454748] 23 Apr 2024 @ 1279.0 hrs

