
VOLVO EC480EL 311198 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP0007895
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 11002527Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06161808 (Generated: 04/28/2024 22:10:09) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007895 VCP315559 VCP310314 VCP254029Sample Date 24 Apr 2024 20 Nov 2021 22 Apr 2021 10 Jul 2019Machine Hours 0 4351 3018 481Oil Hours 0 0 0 481Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL SEVERE NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 290 709 249 164
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 12.1 NEG NEGSilicon ppm 28 1788 196 15Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 9Potassium ppm 2 3 0 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 5155 1806 318Copper ppm <1 11 4 <1Lead ppm <1 6 1 0Tin ppm <1 8 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 211 12 0Chromium ppm 1 45 20 3Molybdenum ppm 2 9 0 0Nickel ppm <1 4 1 0Titanium ppm <1 12 2 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 34 14 6Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 204 173 71 0Magnesium ppm 13 25 14 0Zinc ppm 96 124 62 9Phosphorus ppm 1017 755 723 463Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 211 65 92 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06161808 (Generated: 04/28/2024 22:10:13) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 311198\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP0007895] 24 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

