
[[187464 MJ]] VOLVO A45G FS 342342 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP348498
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 187464 MJ

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO.-GARDEN CITY4250 EAST COMMERCE DRIVEGARDEN CITY, KSUS  67846Contact: DAVID DONAHOEddonahoe@vankeppel.comT: (620)272-0535F: (620)272-0543
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0113Unique No: 11003233Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0113 [WUSCAR] 06162514 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:32:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID DONAHOE - VOLVO0113

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP348498 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10047 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 47 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 20 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 48 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 59 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1117 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 981 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1293 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1076 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0113 [WUSCAR] 06162514 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:32:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID DONAHOE - VOLVO0113
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G FS 342342\Diesel Engine [VCP348498] 23 Apr 2024 @ 10047.0 hrs

