
[[RSO037772]] HITACHI ZX245 514303 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP438622
Oil Type: HITACHI HYDRAULIC SUPER EX 46HN
Job No: RSO037772

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: WILL BICEwbice@cowin.comT: (762)207-0004F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 11003479Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 May 2024
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06162760 (Generated: 05/01/2024 14:59:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL BICE - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438622 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 685 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.9 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.163 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 1769 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 290 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 34 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/15/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 31 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 550 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06162760 (Generated: 05/01/2024 14:59:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL BICE - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	HITACHI HITACHI ZX245 514303\Hydraulic System [VCP438622] 25 Apr 2024 @ 684.5 hrs

