
[[SPM702170 ALTER S]] SENNEBOGEN 840E 840.0.2195 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP439226
Oil Type: MOBIL SHC 630
Job No: SPM702170 ALTER S

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: MARK DEROSAmark.derosa@altg.comT: (248)356-5200F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The copper level is abnormal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 11004017Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06163298 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:25:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439226 VCP396745 VCP351985 ---Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 04 Apr 2023 30 Dec 2021 ---Machine Hours 11148 8847 5443 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 215 217 227 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 61 24 20 ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 0 ---Potassium ppm 4 <1 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 241 157 38 ---Copper ppm 185 23 6 ---Lead ppm <1 0 0 ---Tin ppm 6 3 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 7 <1 0 ---Chromium ppm 3 1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 192 7 0 ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 0 ---Zinc ppm 98 45 15 ---Phosphorus ppm 485 453 345 ---Barium ppm 1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 7 <1 5 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06163298 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:25:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 840E 840.0.2195\Right Swing Drive [VCP439226] 16 Apr 2024 @ 11148.0 hrs

