
[[SPM702170 ALTER S]] SENNEBOGEN 840E 840.0.2195 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP367137
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM702170 ALTER S

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 11004028Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06163309 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:25:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP367137 VCP433819 VCP399574 VCP351990Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 17 Nov 2023 04 Apr 2023 30 Dec 2021Machine Hours 11148 10000 8847 5443Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 141 144 147 149
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 2 4 2Sodium ppm <1 2 0 0Potassium ppm 1 4 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 3 4 3Copper ppm 1 2 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 0 0Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 11 0 <1 <1Magnesium ppm 1 0 0 0Zinc ppm 7 <1 2 6Phosphorus ppm 658 1920 2168 1921Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 25 162 166 186

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06163309 (Generated: 05/03/2024 21:25:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 840E 840.0.2195\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP367137] 16 Apr 2024 @ 11148.0 hrs

