
VOLVO A60H 350190 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP445490
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 11004050Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 May 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06163331 (Generated: 05/03/2024 22:24:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445490 VCP414806 VCP434747 VCP395254Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 12 Dec 2023 05 Sep 2023 05 May 2023Machine Hours 3617 3131 2618 2128Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.0 41.8 41.7 42.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 20 23 21 31Sodium ppm 11 13 13 14Potassium ppm 0 0 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 58 62 54 94Copper ppm 495 453 432 367Lead ppm 0 3 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 1 1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 <1Nickel ppm 3 5 4 4Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 5 4 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3745 3899 3884 4562Magnesium ppm 13 15 16 18Zinc ppm 1410 1461 1431 1640Phosphorus ppm 1354 1290 1270 1341Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 126 133 142 157

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06163331 (Generated: 05/03/2024 22:24:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350190\Brake [VCP445490] 15 Apr 2024 @ 3617.0 hrs

