
[[702593]] 5729 VOLVO L180 5729 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP449809
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 702593

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - SUTTON5220 DOVER STREETTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: F: (813)677-3007
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRATAMFLUnique No: 11005584Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 May 2024
Report Id: TRATAMFL [WUSCAR] 06164865 (Generated: 05/03/2024 16:40:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRATAMFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449809 VCP446634 VCP432667 VCP419013Sample Date 22 Apr 2024 13 Feb 2024 04 Dec 2023 11 Oct 2023Machine Hours 3545 2754 2153 1427Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.7 43.8 43.6 41.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.300 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 9 15 11 11Sodium ppm 1 0 2 3Potassium ppm 0 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 45 31 49 62Copper ppm 2 1 2 4Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 2 <1 <1Chromium ppm 1 <1 2 2Molybdenum ppm 2 1 2 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 2 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4003 3816 3933 3607Magnesium ppm 28 22 0 12Zinc ppm 1534 1559 1406 1527Phosphorus ppm 1311 1204 1112 1300Barium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Boron ppm 115 137 142 122

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRATAMFL [WUSCAR] 06164865 (Generated: 05/03/2024 16:40:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRATAMFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 5729 VOLVO L180 5729\Front Axle [VCP449809] 22 Apr 2024 @ 3545.0 hrs

