
480166 VOLVO L180H 5286 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP371021
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

ADVANTAGE METALS RECYCLING - 12 STREET1153 S. 12TH STREETKANSAS CITY, KSUS  66105Contact: JOHN PEEKjohn.peek@advantagerecycling.comT: (660)424-9134F: (913)621-2766
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ADVKANLHUnique No: 11005952Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 May 2024
Report Id: ADVKANLH [WUSCAR] 06165233 (Generated: 05/03/2024 20:43:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN PEEK - ADVKANLH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP371021 DJJ0013915 DJJ0014227 DJJ0014223Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 17 Oct 2023 20 Jun 2023 13 Apr 2023Machine Hours 9973 9515 9008 8501Oil Hours 0 0 9008 500Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 43.2 43.0 42.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 17 13 13 13Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 1Potassium ppm 3 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 43 19 17 11Copper ppm 5 2 <1 <1Lead ppm 2 <1 0 0Tin ppm 2 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3735 4222 4013 4129Magnesium ppm 14 13 18 15Zinc ppm 1486 1737 1635 1609Phosphorus ppm 1327 1186 1251 1302Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 141 138 135 144

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ADVKANLH [WUSCAR] 06165233 (Generated: 05/03/2024 20:43:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN PEEK - ADVKANLH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 480166 VOLVO L180H 5286\Rear Axle [VCP371021] 15 Apr 2024 @ 9973.0 hrs

