
[[SWA534849-10]] VOLVO A40G 342112 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP438436
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA534849-10

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of visiblesilt present in the sample. There is alight concentration of water presentin the oil. The AN level is acceptablefor this fluid. The condition of the oilis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 11006357Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 02 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06165638 (Generated: 05/03/2024 13:51:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438436 VCP323487 VCP299512 VCP289855Sample Date 27 Apr 2024 16 Jun 2021 07 Jan 2021 30 Oct 2020Machine Hours 7700 6149 5369 4895Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.5 43.9 44.2 42.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.61 0.321 0.294 0.375
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.114 NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm --- --- 4345 ---Particles >6µm --- --- 1480 ---Particles >14µm --- --- 169 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- --- 19/18/15 ---Silicon ppm 4 7 31 11Sodium ppm 1 2 3 3Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 7 7 10Copper ppm 3 4 3 7Lead ppm <1 2 1 3Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 4 2 6Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 411 87 72 84Magnesium ppm 6 6 8 2Zinc ppm 542 424 378 421Phosphorus ppm 440 324 302 330Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 2 4 2 6

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06165638 (Generated: 05/03/2024 13:51:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342112\Hydraulic System [VCP438436] 27 Apr 2024 @ 7700.0 hrs

