
[[6002]] VOLVO A35D 72359 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP434256
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 6002

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 11007266Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 May 2024
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06166547 (Generated: 05/07/2024 13:08:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434256 VCP401514 VCP406173 VCP391333Sample Date 24 Apr 2024 04 Oct 2023 25 Apr 2023 04 Nov 2022Machine Hours 13535 13040 12500 12130Oil Hours 0 0 500 115Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.8 12.1 12.1 12.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.9 10.2 9.2 12.4Oxidation (PA) % 78 79 73 82
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.7 0.6 0.4 0.1Nitration (PA) % 58 56 50 48Sulfation (PA) % 63 62 57 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.0 <1.0 3.3 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 5 5 4Sodium ppm 1 3 2 2Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 6 8 3Copper ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 38 42 38 38Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1653 1719 1575 1567Magnesium ppm 488 549 481 486Zinc ppm 1070 1243 1084 1085Phosphorus ppm 922 1021 876 882Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 52 48 57 61

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06166547 (Generated: 05/07/2024 13:08:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72359\Diesel Engine [VCP434256] 24 Apr 2024 @ 13535.0 hrs

