
VOLVO A40G 342253 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443364
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 11008803Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 May 2024
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06168084 (Generated: 05/04/2024 04:31:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443364 VCP442847 VCP442504 VCP442859Sample Date 19 Apr 2024 11 Mar 2024 05 Feb 2024 06 Dec 2023Machine Hours 11686 11433 11196 10949Oil Hours 253 237 247 252Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 12.6 12.5 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 9.7 8.4 7.0Oxidation (PA) % 77 75 69 59
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 51 54 58 68Sulfation (PA) % 59 58 55 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 5 7Sodium ppm 6 6 7 18Potassium ppm 2 4 7 13
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 5 4Copper ppm <1 1 1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 5 3 7Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 42 56 80 132Nickel ppm 2 1 1 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 0Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1742 1566 1426 1289Magnesium ppm 470 524 553 687Zinc ppm 853 896 851 902Phosphorus ppm 755 767 775 736Barium ppm 0 0 12 0Boron ppm 62 69 96 140

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06168084 (Generated: 05/04/2024 04:31:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342253\Diesel Engine [VCP443364] 19 Apr 2024 @ 11686.0 hrs

