
[[2086 711 MATERIALS]] VOLVO A45G 352955 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437828
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 2086 711 MATERIALS

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT8594 FRUITRIDGE ROADSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95826Contact: RAY KRANZUSCHray.kranzusch@vcesvolvo.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO4485Unique No: 11008812Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 06168093 (Generated: 05/11/2024 02:39:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437828 VCP428960 VCP400963 VCP398271Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 17 Jan 2024 01 May 2023 10 Feb 2023Machine Hours 3502 3084 2039 1729Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.7 12.6 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 8.6 8.8 10.2Oxidation (PA) % 80 78 78 82
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.4 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 63 74 58 59Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 57 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.9 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 6 6 6Sodium ppm 3 3 3 2Potassium ppm 0 0 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 9 6 7Copper ppm <1 3 <1 4Lead ppm 0 <1 1 0Tin ppm 2 <1 1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 38 35 41 42Nickel ppm 3 2 2 2Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1771 1773 1668 1726Magnesium ppm 479 575 531 488Zinc ppm 1056 1187 1168 1171Phosphorus ppm 926 993 972 988Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 39 38 44 57

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 06168093 (Generated: 05/11/2024 02:39:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352955\Diesel Engine [VCP437828] 18 Apr 2024 @ 3502.0 hrs

