
[[703416 WASTE CONN]] VOLVO L150 7318 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP451296
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 703416 WASTE CONN

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 11009026Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06168307 (Generated: 05/06/2024 08:50:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP451296 VCP438424 VCP455290 ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 17 Apr 2024 15 Mar 2024 ---Machine Hours 0 515 250 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.0 44.0 43.0 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.39 0.45 0.51 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 2040 5897 --- ---Particles >6µm 260 1659 --- ---Particles >14µm 24 140 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/15/12 20/18/14 --- ---Silicon ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Sodium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 0 0 ---Copper ppm <1 1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 54 53 ---Magnesium ppm 1 2 <1 ---Zinc ppm 409 416 436 ---Phosphorus ppm 327 314 333 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 0 0 0 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06168307 (Generated: 05/06/2024 08:50:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150 7318\Hydraulic System [VCP451296] 29 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

