
[[SWO-071394]] VOLVO A60H 350187 - GEARBOX

Sample No: VCP452739
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWO-071394

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. Moderate concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 11009473Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 May 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06168754 (Generated: 05/07/2024 16:25:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452739 VCP428920 --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 06 Sep 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 3015 2021 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.4 49.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 28 19 --- ---Sodium ppm 9 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 73 84 --- ---Copper ppm 384 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 4 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4223 371 --- ---Magnesium ppm 26 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 1519 164 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1396 2421 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 185 283 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06168754 (Generated: 05/07/2024 16:25:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350187\Gearbox [VCP452739] 29 Apr 2024 @ 3015.0 hrs

