
 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP441829
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

EHC CONSTRUCTION2945 VAN BUREN STFORT MYERS, FLUS  33913Contact: MATT HUNTmhunt@ehcconstruction.comT: (239)253-9285F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Piston, ring and cylinderwear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: EHCFORUnique No: 11015849Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: EHCFOR [WUSCAR] 06169796 (Generated: 05/08/2024 12:49:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT HUNT - EHCFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441829 VCP225552 VCP375762 VCP336681Sample Date 30 Apr 2024 26 Jan 2023 26 May 2022 07 Apr 2022Machine Hours 10954 10062 9404 9284Oil Hours 500 500 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 13.6 13.9 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 10.4 10.7 11.5Oxidation (PA) % 64 60 59 84
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.5 0.6 0.2 0.5Nitration (PA) % 70 68 49 83Sulfation (PA) % 55 54 52 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 15 4 3 6Sodium ppm 2 2 1 2Potassium ppm 2 9 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 84 14 6 40Copper ppm 6 <1 <1 1Lead ppm 1 3 <1 <1Tin ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 42 6 3 13Chromium ppm 4 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 64 44 56 44Nickel ppm 1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1089 824 1140 1581Magnesium ppm 920 771 880 630Zinc ppm 1224 1041 1198 1220Phosphorus ppm 1046 772 1021 1024Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 5 0 10 25

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: EHCFOR [WUSCAR] 06169796 (Generated: 05/08/2024 12:49:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT HUNT - EHCFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO \Diesel Engine [VCP441829] 30 Apr 2024 @ 10954.0 hrs

