
VOLVO EC350EL 314575 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP436465
Oil Type: VALVOLINE ALLFLEET 30
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 11016391Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06170338 (Generated: 05/08/2024 15:23:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436465 VCP438660 --- ---Sample Date 30 Apr 2024 10 Jan 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 0 1057 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 172 174 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 10 9 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 265 272 --- ---Copper ppm <1 1 --- ---Lead ppm 1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 2 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 7 6 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 27 40 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 16 0 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 342 394 --- ---Barium ppm 2 5 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06170338 (Generated: 05/08/2024 15:23:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314575\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP436465] 30 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

