
[[SPM702852]] 2284 VOLVO L70 2284 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP438870
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM702852

U-PULL-AND-PAY LLC  - WEST PALM BEACH551 BENOIST FARMS ROADWEST PALM BEACH, FLUS  33411Contact: DAVID OZIMEKdavid.ozimek@upullandpay.comT: (561)846-1597F: (561)793-2449
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount ofsilt (particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The oil viscosity ishigher than normal. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: UPUWESUnique No: 11017154Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: UPUWES [WUSCAR] 06171101 (Generated: 05/10/2024 10:48:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID OZIMEK - UPUWES

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438870 VCP344809 VCP270850 DJJ04767681Sample Date 01 May 2024 09 Oct 2021 27 Feb 2020 01 Aug 2019Machine Hours 19728 17044 16041 0Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd N/ASample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 55.4 54.4 47.9 45.2Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 0.312 0.476 0.483
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 11148 13878 69725 38050Particles >6µm 1811 1979 21680 9495Particles >14µm 100 60 1666 819ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/14 21/18/13 23/22/18 22/20/17Silicon ppm 3 2 15 16Sodium ppm 0 <1 5 5Potassium ppm <1 0 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 3 14 12Copper ppm 2 1 3 2Lead ppm 1 <1 1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 2 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 2 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 56 134 122Magnesium ppm 5 2 10 10Zinc ppm 486 403 452 352Phosphorus ppm 436 332 340 282Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 2 2 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UPUWES [WUSCAR] 06171101 (Generated: 05/10/2024 10:48:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID OZIMEK - UPUWES
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 2284 VOLVO L70 2284\Hydraulic System [VCP438870] 01 May 2024 @ 19728.0 hrs

