
[[SPM703242 BL DUKE]] SENNOBOGEN 835M 835.0.2625 - FRONT DIFFERENTIAL

Sample No: VCP447024
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM703242 BL DUKE

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: MARK DEROSAmark.derosa@altg.comT: (248)356-5200F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 11017774Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06171721 (Generated: 05/08/2024 16:33:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447024 VCP425312 VCP354522 ---Sample Date 01 May 2024 18 Oct 2023 13 Apr 2022 ---Machine Hours 6131 4991 1220 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 153 185 185 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 6 2 2 ---Sodium ppm <1 4 4 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 19 103 ---Copper ppm 10 24 15 ---Lead ppm <1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 2 ---Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 0 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 81 12 ---Magnesium ppm 40 0 1 ---Zinc ppm 75 40 51 ---Phosphorus ppm 663 1164 1099 ---Barium ppm 100 392 305 ---Boron ppm 7 0 2 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06171721 (Generated: 05/08/2024 16:33:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNOBOGEN SENNOBOGEN 835M 835.0.2625\Front Differential [VCP447024] 01 May 2024 @ 6131.0 hrs

