
[[527633]] VOLVO L60H 623294 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP447472
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 527633

RECYCLE AMERICA12100 YOUNG PINE RDORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: RECORLUnique No: 11018408Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 10 May 2024
Report Id: RECORL [WUSCAR] 06172355 (Generated: 05/10/2024 11:05:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - RECORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447472 VCP428815 VCP429678 VCP432068Sample Date 05 Apr 2024 14 Feb 2024 14 Dec 2023 11 Oct 2023Machine Hours 2319 2013 1736 1079Oil Hours 500 500 0 1079Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.2 13.0 12.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.5 10.3 11.2 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 73 75 76 72
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.5Nitration (PA) % 54 53 39 69Sulfation (PA) % 57 58 60 58Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.6Silicon ppm 23 21 7 26Sodium ppm 2 1 1 5Potassium ppm 2 0 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 6 1 39Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 12Lead ppm <1 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 4Aluminum ppm 4 3 1 9Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 3Molybdenum ppm 41 40 38 35Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1723 1582 1488 1655Magnesium ppm 610 494 456 551Zinc ppm 1175 1041 1016 1091Phosphorus ppm 1028 923 809 935Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 45 46 67 19

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RECORL [WUSCAR] 06172355 (Generated: 05/10/2024 11:05:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - RECORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 623294\Diesel Engine [VCP447472] 05 Apr 2024 @ 2319.0 hrs

