
[[527681 WASTE MGMT]] VOLVO L60H 622532 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP446349
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 527681 WASTE MGMT

WASTE MANAGEMENT TAMPA TRANSFER3518 4TH AVETAMPA, FLUS  33605Contact: JOHN POLLOCKjpollock2@wm.comT: (813)247-7397F: (813)247-4847
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WASTAMUnique No: 11018956Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 May 2024
Report Id: WASTAM [WUSCAR] 06172903 (Generated: 05/13/2024 14:34:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN POLLOCK - WASTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446349 VCP442540 VCP433330 VCP395971Sample Date 05 Apr 2024 14 Feb 2024 11 Oct 2023 31 Jan 2023Machine Hours 11071 10530 9385 7204Oil Hours 2000 2000 4000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.8 40.3 39.8 40.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 13 15 15 15Sodium ppm 0 11 11 12Potassium ppm 0 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 228 187 204Copper ppm 0 2 2 3Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 7 6 7Molybdenum ppm 43 3 2 5Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 12 10 11Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3928 4005 3757 4112Magnesium ppm 41 0 9 17Zinc ppm 1583 1652 1621 1656Phosphorus ppm 1311 1402 1257 1287Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 154 133 119 149

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASTAM [WUSCAR] 06172903 (Generated: 05/13/2024 14:34:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN POLLOCK - WASTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622532\Front Axle [VCP446349] 05 Apr 2024 @ 11071.0 hrs

