
[[527681]] VOLVO L60H 622532 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP440027
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 527681

WASTE MANAGEMENT TAMPA TRANSFER3518 4TH AVETAMPA, FLUS  33605Contact: JOHN POLLOCKjpollock2@wm.comT: (813)247-7397F: (813)247-4847
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WASTAMUnique No: 11018974Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 May 2024
Report Id: WASTAM [WUSCAR] 06172921 (Generated: 05/10/2024 18:59:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN POLLOCK - WASTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440027 VCP444308 VCP429201 VCP395973Sample Date 05 Apr 2024 14 Feb 2024 11 Oct 2023 31 Jan 2023Machine Hours 11071 10530 9385 7204Oil Hours 2000 2000 4000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.3 41.5 39.6 40.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.391 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 13 15 14 14Sodium ppm 0 10 9 11Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 43 564 427 186Copper ppm <1 16 13 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 1Tin ppm <1 2 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 1 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 9 7 6Molybdenum ppm 50 21 14 4Nickel ppm 0 3 3 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 20 16 11Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3928 4013 3653 3816Magnesium ppm 44 0 8 16Zinc ppm 1592 1628 1582 1574Phosphorus ppm 1292 1415 1268 1180Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 150 132 111 133

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASTAM [WUSCAR] 06172921 (Generated: 05/10/2024 19:00:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN POLLOCK - WASTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622532\Rear Axle [VCP440027] 05 Apr 2024 @ 11071.0 hrs

