
[[25455]] VOLVO A45 352887 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP422202
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 25455

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: ANN BRESCHann.bresch@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. The ironlevel is abnormal. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 11019027Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06172974 (Generated: 05/10/2024 19:22:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANN BRESCH - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422202 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3781 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 25 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 --- --- ---Copper ppm 217 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 7 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3579 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1511 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1289 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 134 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06172974 (Generated: 05/10/2024 19:22:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANN BRESCH - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45 352887\Wet Disc Brake [VCP422202] 02 May 2024 @ 3781.0 hrs

