
[[688678]] VOLVO L150H 6057 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP438338
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 688678

PARAGON DEVELOPMENT GROUP402 N FRONTAGE RDPLANT CITY, FLUS  33563Contact: ED WALPOLEedwiv@pdgpc.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: PARPLAUnique No: 11019097Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 10 May 2024
Report Id: PARPLA [WUSCAR] 06173044 (Generated: 05/10/2024 13:50:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED WALPOLE - PARPLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438338 VCP452330 VCP440799 VCP392972Sample Date 25 Mar 2024 17 Jan 2024 30 Oct 2023 10 Aug 2023Machine Hours 12571 12014 11520 11051Oil Hours 500 2000 1000 3000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.7 28.0 27.5 27.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG 0.105 NEGSilicon ppm 5 3 4 3Sodium ppm 0 0 2 3Potassium ppm 2 1 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 151 123 153 145Copper ppm 7 6 6 6Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 2 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 66 70 73Magnesium ppm 1 <1 2 0Zinc ppm 8 0 3 0Phosphorus ppm 174 221 186 184Barium ppm 0 10 0 0Boron ppm 81 69 73 83

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PARPLA [WUSCAR] 06173044 (Generated: 05/10/2024 13:50:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED WALPOLE - PARPLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6057\Transmission (Auto) [VCP438338] 25 Mar 2024 @ 12571.0 hrs

