
[[SW-33330-2 CASTLE VA]] VOLVO EC480E 314667 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP395776
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SW-33330-2 CASTLE VA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 11019675Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06173622 (Generated: 05/15/2024 19:23:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP395776 VCP440148 VCP443486 VCP411628Sample Date 02 May 2024 19 Feb 2024 27 Nov 2023 11 Sep 2023Machine Hours 0 5031 4494 4022Oil Hours 0 230 490 400Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 11.9 12.4 12.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.2 6.0 7.3 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 53 61 62 60
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 75 76 69 58Sulfation (PA) % 58 54 53 53Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.0 0.5 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 4 4 4Sodium ppm 12 2 <1 2Potassium ppm 0 1 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 5 5 4Copper ppm <1 1 <1 1Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 32 60 62 67Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 1 1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1924 1154 1169 1240Magnesium ppm 388 723 745 1087Zinc ppm 991 1122 1151 1350Phosphorus ppm 884 863 925 1090Barium ppm 0 34 2 0Boron ppm 17 10 15 6

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06173622 (Generated: 05/15/2024 19:24:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314667\Diesel Engine [VCP395776] 02 May 2024 @ .0 hrs

