
[[W05004186]] VOLVO A40F 11613 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP412080
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: W05004186

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 11019883Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06173830 (Generated: 05/16/2024 14:16:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412080 VCP195605 VCP199355 ---Sample Date 23 Apr 2024 23 May 2017 30 Aug 2016 ---Machine Hours 15926 6189 4160 ---Oil Hours 2000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.7 41.87 39.93 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.70 0.405 0.581 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles 5-15µm count --- 218698 --- ---Particles 15-25µm count --- 40594 --- ---Particles 25-50µm count --- 13106 --- ---Particles 50-100µm count --- 227 --- ---Particles >100µm count --- 161 --- ---NAS Code --- 11 --- ---Particles >4µm 1564 6986 713 ---Particles >6µm 88 2877 388 ---Particles >14µm 12 548 66 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/14/11 20/19/16 17/16/13 ---Silicon ppm 13 13 19 ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 2 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 6 9 ---Copper ppm 1 4 6 ---Lead ppm 0 2 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 1 ---Aluminum ppm 3 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1361 177 177 ---Magnesium ppm 31 3 2 ---Zinc ppm 532 423 435 ---Phosphorus ppm 642 364 353 ---Barium ppm <1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 7 2 3 --- Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06173830 (Generated: 05/16/2024 14:16:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40F 11613\Hydraulic System [VCP412080] 23 Apr 2024 @ 15926.0 hrs

