
[[5520DR KINSLEY]] VOLVO A40E 13563 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP431873
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 5520DR KINSLEY

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY COPO BOX 127DRUMS, PAUS  18222Contact: JOSEPH GLOWACKIjoe@hwyequip.comT: (570)788-1127F: (570)708-2933
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The iron level is abnormal.Gear wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0022Unique No: 11020320Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 13 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0022 [WUSCAR] 06174267 (Generated: 05/13/2024 12:00:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSEPH GLOWACKI - VOLVO0022

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431873 VCP146015 --- ---Sample Date 03 May 2024 21 Jun 2013 --- ---Machine Hours 13358 2149 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 268 300.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 43 6 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 547 38 --- ---Copper ppm 1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 9 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 45 2 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 7 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 158 64 --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 5 --- ---Zinc ppm 144 73 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1239 992 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 128 55 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0022 [WUSCAR] 06174267 (Generated: 05/13/2024 12:00:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSEPH GLOWACKI - VOLVO0022
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40E 13563\Drop Box [VCP431873] 03 May 2024 @ 13358.0 hrs

