
[[42079]]  - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP453821
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 42079

LANDMARK CONSTRUCTION CO. INC./MEM3255 INDUSTRY DRIVENORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: GENE RICHARDSONgrichardson@landmark-sc.comT: (843)767-9741F: (843)767-9909
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Valve wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: LANNORUnique No: 11021266Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 May 2024
Report Id: LANNOR [WUSCAR] 06175213 (Generated: 05/13/2024 15:24:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GENE RICHARDSON - LANNOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453821 VCP454617 VCP407066 VCP381043Sample Date 08 May 2024 29 Mar 2024 11 Sep 2023 03 May 2023Machine Hours 5998 5825 5818 5272Oil Hours 0 6 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd N/A Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.5 12.9 13.2 14.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.4 10.5 6.5 9.0Oxidation (PA) % 76 74 54 49
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.1 0.5 0.1Nitration (PA) % 53 43 64 39Sulfation (PA) % 60 59 51 43Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 9 6 6Sodium ppm 3 3 6 2Potassium ppm 0 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 6 17 6Copper ppm 6 5 17 7Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 3 2 3 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 1 0Molybdenum ppm 41 39 59 61Nickel ppm 10 6 6 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1594 1513 1109 1138Magnesium ppm 550 559 864 1032Zinc ppm 1084 1093 1144 1390Phosphorus ppm 952 948 967 1085Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 56 64 13 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LANNOR [WUSCAR] 06175213 (Generated: 05/13/2024 15:24:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GENE RICHARDSON - LANNOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO \Diesel Engine [VCP453821] 08 May 2024 @ 5998.0 hrs

