
[[VFS]] VOLVO A40G 342632 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP428508
Oil Type: CHEVRON 1000 THF
Job No: VFS

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 11021916Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06175863 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:43:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428508 VCP348938 --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 03 Feb 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 7835 6440 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.8 44.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 17 19 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 7 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 35 --- ---Copper ppm 210 204 --- ---Lead ppm <1 1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 1 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 5 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3711 3780 --- ---Magnesium ppm 29 24 --- ---Zinc ppm 1544 1549 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1445 1355 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 156 115 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06175863 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:43:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342632\Brake Cooling System [VCP428508] 29 Apr 2024 @ 7835.0 hrs

