
[[1027787 CUSTOM LS]] VOLVO L350H 1103 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP437999
Oil Type: ATF
Job No: 1027787 CUSTOM LS

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 11022026Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06175973 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:42:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437999 VCP337810 VCP339435 ---Sample Date 02 May 2024 29 Sep 2022 29 Oct 2021 ---Machine Hours 7020 5529 4320 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 123 84.1 83.5 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 11 15 6 ---Sodium ppm 3 3 3 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 50 22 ---Copper ppm <1 37 26 ---Lead ppm <1 2 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 1 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 33 15 1 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2248 2814 3064 ---Magnesium ppm 344 37 13 ---Zinc ppm 1185 1157 1124 ---Phosphorus ppm 1028 1040 1037 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 79 37 23 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06175973 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:42:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L350H 1103\Transmission (Manual) [VCP437999] 02 May 2024 @ 7020.0 hrs

