
VOLVO EC300EL 312525 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP382976
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

DUNN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENTROUTE 2 BOX 71A, 3303 US HWY 12 EASTMENOMONIE, WIUS  54751Contact: DANNY NELSONdnelson@co.dunn.wi.usT: (715)232-2361F: (715)232-3888
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DUNMENUnique No: 11022909Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 May 2024
Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06176856 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:13:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP382976 VC527561 VC549440 ---Sample Date 08 May 2024 29 Mar 2023 20 Jul 2022 ---Machine Hours 1176 1009 935 ---Oil Hours 167 156 235 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 13.0 15.0 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 8.3 9.1 ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 57 51 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 48 45 58 ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 48 52 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 9 8 6 ---Sodium ppm 0 1 1 ---Potassium ppm 4 4 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 4 ---Copper ppm 5 1 1 ---Lead ppm <1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 3 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 30 30 25 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 2 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1866 1661 2159 ---Magnesium ppm 315 287 190 ---Zinc ppm 1013 875 1077 ---Phosphorus ppm 937 730 910 ---Barium ppm 2 0 0 ---Boron ppm 32 42 32 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06176856 (Generated: 05/14/2024 13:13:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300EL 312525\Diesel Engine [VCP382976] 08 May 2024 @ 1176.0 hrs

