
PETERBILT 337 CM143534 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP376608
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

SILVERPOINT ENTERPRISES637N 2743EROBERTS, IDUS  83444Contact: BRADLEY HAHNsilverpointenterprises20@gmail.comT: (208)270-1141F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high.Test for glycol is negative. The BNlevel is low. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SILROBIDUnique No: 11022910Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 May 2024
Report Id: SILROBID [WUSCAR] 06176857 (Generated: 05/17/2024 08:02:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADLEY HAHN - SILROBID

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP376608 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 25000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 3.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 265 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 2.5 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 230 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 122 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 21 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 87 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 241 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 9 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 11 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1531 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 465 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1158 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1027 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 96 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SILROBID [WUSCAR] 06176857 (Generated: 05/17/2024 08:02:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADLEY HAHN - SILROBID
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PETERBILT PETERBILT 337 CM143534\Diesel Engine [VCP376608] 24 Mar 2024 @ 25000.0 hrs

