
[[SW-33842-2 CASTLE VA]] VOLVO EC355 314020 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP397205
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-33842-2 CASTLE VA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil viscosity is higher thannormal. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 11023561Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06177508 (Generated: 05/15/2024 14:00:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP397205 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3270 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 242 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 2.06 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 29 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 885 --- --- ---Copper ppm 27 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 9 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 93 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1232 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 136 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06177508 (Generated: 05/15/2024 14:00:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC355 314020\Right Swing Drive [VCP397205] 03 May 2024 @ 3270.0 hrs

