
[[SWA548546]] VOLVO A25G 742077 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP442222
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWA548546

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The fluidchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. There is a highconcentration of water present in thefluid. The fluid is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11030528Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06179202 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:25:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442222 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6024 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.08 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 36 --- --- ---Copper ppm 384 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3109 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1318 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1176 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 127 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06179202 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:25:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742077\Brake Cooling System [VCP442222] 10 May 2024 @ 6024.0 hrs

