
[[X48144]] VOLVO EC380EL 311913 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP450956
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W80
Job No: X48144

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level hasdecreased, but is still abnormal. Gearwear is indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil viscosity is higher thannormal. Confirm oil type. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11030529Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06179203 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:21:14) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450956 VCP340394 --- ---Sample Date 08 May 2024 23 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 6192 4252 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 296 161 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 201 381 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 14 20 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 985 2109 --- ---Copper ppm 6 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 53 81 --- ---Chromium ppm 14 35 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 4 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 4 6 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 16 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 160 124 --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 36 23 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1031 849 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 174 91 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06179203 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:21:16) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 311913\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP450956] 08 May 2024 @ 6192.0 hrs

