
[[X48144]] VOLVO EC380EL 311913 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454689
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W80
Job No: X48144

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11030531Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06179205 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:21:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454689 VCP439332 VCP340406 ---Sample Date 08 May 2024 21 Mar 2024 23 Jun 2022 ---Machine Hours 6192 6188 4252 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A N/A ---Sample Status NORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 165 159 141 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 5.46 0.876 ---Silicon ppm 22 24 17 ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 0 ---Potassium ppm <1 2 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 95 1190 957 ---Copper ppm 20 67 57 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 2 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 5 4 ---Chromium ppm 2 10 7 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 3 8 6 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 9 58 26 ---Magnesium ppm <1 4 1 ---Zinc ppm 32 86 67 ---Phosphorus ppm 303 966 919 ---Barium ppm 4 0 0 ---Boron ppm 1 25 30 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06179205 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:21:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 311913\Swing Drive [VCP454689] 08 May 2024 @ 6192.0 hrs

