
[[12816 APAC]] VOLVO EC480EL 314970 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442477
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 12816 APAC

536 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CHATTANOOGA7829 LEE HWYCHATTANOOGA, TNUS  37421Contact: WILLIAM WALKERwilliam.walker@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (423)308-7959
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0117Unique No: 11031028Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06179702 (Generated: 05/17/2024 09:43:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442477 VCP379652 --- ---Sample Date 26 Apr 2024 17 Nov 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2430 1866 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.2 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 6.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 90 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.4 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 70 86 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 65 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 0.4 1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 13 --- ---Sodium ppm 8 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 8 --- ---Copper ppm 4 16 --- ---Lead ppm <1 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 3 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 42 46 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1699 1661 --- ---Magnesium ppm 499 507 --- ---Zinc ppm 1125 1196 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1085 965 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 52 29 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06179702 (Generated: 05/17/2024 09:43:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314970\Diesel Engine [VCP442477] 26 Apr 2024 @ 2430.0 hrs

