
[[W0230543]] VOLVO L260H 1353 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP429426
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: W0230543

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: ROB HOLCOMBrholcomb@romco.comT: (817)798-9289F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 11031424Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06180098 (Generated: 05/17/2024 16:47:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429426 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3991 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 50.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.20 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 156622 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 44240 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 690 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/23/17 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2778 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1274 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1112 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06180098 (Generated: 05/17/2024 16:47:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H 1353\Hydraulic System [VCP429426] 08 May 2024 @ .0 hrs

