
[[A12543]] VOLVO L180H 4165 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP438210
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A12543

WASTE MANAGEMENT - TELFORD400 PROGRESS DRTELFORD, PAUS  18969-1191Contact: EDWARD ROGENERerogener@wm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: WASTELUnique No: 11032246Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 May 2024
Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 06180920 (Generated: 05/24/2024 14:05:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438210 VCP408151 VCP399904 VCP377592Sample Date 02 May 2024 10 Feb 2024 21 Feb 2023 18 May 2022Machine Hours 14045 13485 10932 9703Oil Hours 500 500 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 11.9 12.5 13.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.1 7.2 7.3 9.7Oxidation (PA) % 53 0 46 56
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 61 0 58 49Sulfation (PA) % 53 0 48 52Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 4.9 3.5 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 12 13 8 11Sodium ppm 2 0 3 0Potassium ppm 4 3 4 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 13 5 8Copper ppm 2 1 1 1Lead ppm 2 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 3 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 19 154 32 58Nickel ppm 1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 24 1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2272 1614 1661 1090Magnesium ppm 244 953 399 1055Zinc ppm 1218 1136 1079 1256Phosphorus ppm 1060 1030 875 1039Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 26 156 9 134

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 06180920 (Generated: 05/24/2024 14:05:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 4165\Diesel Engine [VCP438210] 02 May 2024 @ 14045.0 hrs

