
[[A12633]] VOLVO A40G 352005 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP438182
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A12633

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 11032250Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 May 2024
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06180924 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:35:11) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ROBERT LOCKHOFF

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438182 VCP439455 VCP413720 VCP422505Sample Date 06 May 2024 18 Dec 2023 29 Aug 2023 05 Jun 2023Machine Hours 3670 3449 3205 3010Oil Hours 250 0 250 250Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 12.3 13.0 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.7 7.6 7.8 10.8Oxidation (PA) % 68 39 39 81
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 52 50 48 53Sulfation (PA) % 55 43 43 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 0.6 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 3 4 3Sodium ppm <1 0 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 2 4 6Copper ppm 2 0 <1 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 3 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 34 21 15 39Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1687 1876 2191 1659Magnesium ppm 410 293 154 466Zinc ppm 1083 1122 1123 1001Phosphorus ppm 950 955 970 885Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 47 13 15 66

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06180924 (Generated: 05/16/2024 15:35:15) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ROBERT LOCKHOFF
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352005\Diesel Engine [VCP438182] 06 May 2024 @ 3670.0 hrs

