
[[14802 STANLEY]] VOLVO A35G 342021 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP418135
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 14802 STANLEY

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 11032258Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06180932 (Generated: 05/20/2024 08:41:39) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Austin Malkemus

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418135 ML0001530 VCP447973 VCP414579Sample Date 13 May 2024 18 Apr 2024 19 Dec 2023 10 Oct 2023Machine Hours 8598 8487 8036 7675Oil Hours 100 8487 0 500Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.6 12.9 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.6 8.8 5.9 6.1Oxidation (PA) % 76 68 54 56
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 51 108 76 78Sulfation (PA) % 61 65 51 52Glycol % NEG 0.10 NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 20 4 5Sodium ppm 219 1470 27 28Potassium ppm 23 137 3 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 19 3 9Copper ppm 2 11 <1 2Lead ppm <1 1 0 2Tin ppm <1 <1 0 1Aluminum ppm 2 3 3 5Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 44 76 79 81Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1539 1197 1971 2095Magnesium ppm 481 526 28 112Zinc ppm 1054 739 1167 1225Phosphorus ppm 940 625 1009 1007Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 47 20 44 36

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06180932 (Generated: 05/20/2024 08:41:42) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Austin Malkemus
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 342021\Diesel Engine [VCP418135] 13 May 2024 @ 8598.0 hrs

